
No. 280 Housing 

1984 No. 280 

HOUSING; RATES 

1297 

The Housing Benefits (Amendment No. 2) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1984 

Made 

Coming into operation 

Regulations lt04(a), 10andll 
Remainder .................................. . 

7th Augu~t 1984 

1st September 1984 
26th Noyember 1984' 

The Department of Health and Social Services, in exercise of the powers 
conferred on it by Artide 3(2) of the Housing Benefits (Northern Ireland) Order 
1983(a) and acting jointly with the Department of the Environment, in exercise of the 
powers conferred on them by Article 3(1) of that Order, in each case with the consent 
of the Department of Finance and Personnel, and in exercise of all either powers 
enabling them in that behalf, hereby make the following regulations which, except for 
regulation 10, correspond to provision contained in regulations made by the Secretary 
of State in relation to Great Britain, and after agreement by the Social Security 
Advisory Committee that proposals to make regulation 10 shollld not be referred to it, 
and which accordingly , by virtue of section 10(2) of, and paragraph 21 of Schedule 3 
to, the Social Security Act 1980(b) are not subject to the requirement of section 10(1) 
of that Act for prior reference to the Social Security Advisory Committee: 

Citation, commencement and interpretation . 
1.-(1). These regulations may be cited as the Housing Benefits (Amendment No. 

2) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1984 and shall come into operation on 1st 
September 1984 except for regulations 4(b), 5 to 9 and 12 to 14 which shall come into 
operation on 26th November 1984. 

(2) In these regulations "the principal regulations" means the Housing Benefits 
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1983(c). 

Amendment of regulations 5, 6 and 7 of the principal regulations 
2. In regulations 5(1) (eligibility for rate rebate), 6(1) (eligibility for rent rebate) 

and 7(1) (eligibility for rent allowance) for "and 11(2)" on each occasion where it 
appears there shall be substituted", 11(2) and 11A". 

Insertion of regulation llA in the principal regulations 
3. After regulation 11 of the principal regulations there shall be inserted the 

following regulation-

"Students from abroad 
llA.-(1) Except ina certificated case, a student with limited leave or 

without leave to enter or remain in the United Kingdom shall not be eligible for 
housing benefit. 

, (a) S.1. 1983/1121 (N.1. 14) 
(b) 1980 c. 30 
(c) S.R. 1983 No. 292, as amended by S.R. 1984 No. 77 



1298 Housing No_ 280 

(2) In this regulation "student with limited leave or without leave to enter or 
remain in the United Kingdom" means a person who is present in the United 
Kingdom for the purpose of attending a course of education, whether or not he is 
for the time being engaged in a programme of studies, and who-

(a) is a person, other than a national of a member State or a person to whom 
the European Convention on Social and Medical Assistance done at Paris 
on 11th December 1953(a) applies, who has a limited leave (as defined in 
section 33(1) of the Immigration Act 1971(b» to enter or remain in the 
United Kingdom which was given in accordance with any provision of 
immigration rules (as defined in section 33(1) of that Act) which refers to 
there being, or to there needing to be, no recourse to public funds, or to 
there being no charge on public funds, during that limited leave, 

(b) having a limited leave (as defined in section 33(1) of the Immigration 'Act 
1971} to· enter or remain in the United Kingdom, has remained without 
further leave under that Act beyond the time limited by the leave, 

(c) is the subject of a deportation order, that is to say an order within section 
5(1) of the Immigration Act 1971 requiring him to leave and prohibiting 
him from entering the United Kingdom, ot . 

(d) is an illegal entrant (as defined in section 33(1) of the Immigration Act 
1971) who is not given leave under that Act to enter or remain in the 
United Kingdom_" _ 

Amendment of regulation 16 of the principal regulations 
4. In regulation 16 of the principal regulations (eligible rent)-
(a) in paragraph (2)(e) for "£14-70" there shall be substituted "£15-30"; 
(b) after paragraph (3) there shall be inserted the following paragraph-

"(3A) In a certificated case where a rent rebate or a rent allowance is payable 
in accordance with regulation 4(2) in respect of two dwellings, no deduction shall 
be made .under paragraph (2)(b) in respect ofthe dwelling not being occupied by 
the eligible person_ " _ 

Amendment of regulation 18 of the principal regulations 
5.-(1) Regulation 18 of the principal regulations (deductions for noh­

dependants) shall be amended in accordance with the following paragraphs_ 
(2) In paragraph (1)-
(a) for "paragraphs (3) to (7)" there shall be substituted "paragraphs (3) to 

(8B)"; 
(b) for sub-paragraph (a) (i) there shall be substitute4 the following-

"(i) where he is aged 16 or 17, £0-95,"; . 
(c) in sub-paragraph (a)(ii) for "21" there shall be substituted "18" and for 

"£1-85" there shall be substituted "£2-20"; 
(d) in sub-paragraph (a)(iii) for "£0-90" there shall be substituted "£0-95"; 
(e) in sub-paragraph (b) for "£0-90" there shall be substituted "£0-95"_ 
(3) In paragraph (2)-
(a) for "paragraphs (3) to (7)" there shall be substituted "paragraphs (3) to 

(8B)"; 

(a) Cmnd. 9512 
Cb) 1971 c_ 77 



No. 280 Housing 1299 

(b) fQr sub-paragraph (a) (i) there shall be substituted the fQllQwing-
"(i) where he is aged 16 Qr 17, £2·35,"; 

(c) in sub-paragraph (a)(ii) fQr "21" there shall be substituted "18" and fQr 
"£4·70" there shall be substituted "£6·60"; 

(d) in sl,lb-paragraph (a)(iii) fQr "£2·20" there shall be substituted "£2·35"; 
(e) in sub-paragraph (b) fQr "£2·20" there shall be substituted "£2·35". 
(4) In paragraph (8) fQr "regulatiQn 28" there shall be substituted "regulatiQn 

18A". 
(5) After paragraph (8) there shall be inserted the fQllQwing paragraphs­

"(8A) NO' deductiQn shall be made in respect Qf a nQn-dependant fQr any 
periQd befQre the terminal date within the meaning Qf regulatiQn 7 Qf the Child 
Benefit (General) RegulatiQns (NQrthern Ireland) 1979(a). 

(8B) NO' deductiQn shall be made in respect Qf a nQn-dependant aged 16 Qr 17 
whO' is in receipt Qf a nQn-cQntributQry invalidity pensiQn under sectiQn 36 Qf the 
SQcial Security (NQrthern Ireland) Act 1975(b).". " 

Insertion of regulation I 8A in the principal regulations 
6. After regulatiQn 18 Qf the principal regulatiQns there shall be inserted the 

follQwing regulatiQn-
"Lesser deductionsIor non-dependants in certain cases 

18A.-(1) Where a nQn-dependant Qf a claimant fQr a housing benefit in 
respect Qf whQm a deductiQn falls to' be made under regulatiQn 18 (deductiQns fQr 
nQn-dependants) fulfils the specified cQnditiQns and the claimant has furnished 
the apprQpriate authQrity with the necessary infQrmatiQn, the authQrity shall, 
subject to' paragraph (2), determine that the deductiQn in respect Qf that 
nQn-dependant shall be a lesser deductiQn. 

(2) Where a claimant fails to' furnish any necessary infQrmatiQn within six 
weeks Qf being requested in writing to' dO' SO' by the apprQpriate authQrity, the 
authQrity shall be under nO' duty to' make a determinatiQn in accQrdance with 
paragraph (1). 

(3) Subject to' regulatiQns 24 and 25 (duratiQn Qf benefit periQd) a lesser 
deductiQn shall be made SO' as to' take effect· frQm the week in which the 
nQn-dependant in respect QfwhQm the deductiQn falls to' be made first fulfilled the 
necessary cQnditiQns and shall cQntinue to' be made until such time as he ceases to' 
ful(il the cQnditiQnas to' incQme specified in regulatiQn 18(8). 

i(4) In this regulatiQn-
l.lesser deductiQn" means a deductiQn under regulatiQn 18 in accQrdance with 

paragraph (8) Qf that regulatiQn in the calculatiQn Qf a hQusing benefit; 
"necessary infQrmatiQn" means-

(a) a statement signed by the nQn-dependant in respect Qf whQm the 
questiQn Qf a lesser deductiQn arises to' the effect that he fulfils the 
specified cQnditiQns, and 

(b) such Qther infQrmatiQn and evidence as the appropriate authQrity may 
reasQnably require fQr the purpQses Qf making the determinatiQn; 

"specified cQnditiQns" means, in relatiQn to' a non-dependant, bQth Qf the 
fQllowing cQnditiQns-
(a) the cQnditiQn aS,tQ incQme specified in regulatiQn 18(8), and 

Ca) S.R. 1979' No. 5, as amended by S.R. 1980 Np. 261 and S.R. 1982 No. 114 
Cb) 1975 c. 15 



1300 Housing No. 280 

(b) that, for a period of not less than fifty-six consecutive days each day 
was a day-
(i) in respect of which he was in receipt of a benefit specified in 

sub-paragraphs (a) to (c) of regulation 18(8) or would have been 
entitled to any such benefit but for section 14(3) of the Social 
Security (Northern Ireland) Act 1975 (first three days) or section 
17(1)(e) of that Act (Sundays and certain other days),or 

(ii) which, for the purposes of Part II of the 1982 Order (statutory 
sick pay) was a day of incapacity for work in relation to his 
contract of service (and, if more than one, to each such contract) 
and fell within a period of entitlement to statutory sick p"ay. " . 

Amendment of regulation 19(5) of the principal regulations 
7. In regulation 19(5) of the principal regulations (income exceeding needs 

allowance)- . 
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for "7%" there shall be substituted "9%"; 
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for "21 %" there shall be substituted "29%". 

Amendment of regulation 20 of the principal regulations 
8. In regulation 20 of the principal regulations (minimllm and maximum amolints 

of benefit) for paragraph (1) there shall be substituted the following paragraphs-
"(1) If the weekly amount of a housing benefit calculated in accordance with 

the other provisions of these regulations would be less than the appropriate 
minimum, it shall not be granted. 

(lA) In paragraph (1), "appropriate minimum" means-
(a) in a certificated case, a case in which the eligible person has claimed and 

is entitled to supplementary benefit for the purposes of ascertaining which 
a requirement is applicable under regulation 19A of the Requirements 
Regulations (housing benefit supplement) or a case in which the weekly 
income of the eligible person and any partner of his is less than the amount 
of the needs allowance applicable to his case-
(i) for the purposes of a rate rebate, 10 pence per week, and 

(ii) for the purposes of a rent rebate or rent allowance, 20 pence per 
.week; 

(b) in any other case, for the purpose of a rate rebate, rent rebate or rent 
allowance, 50 pence per week.". 

Amendment of regulation 27(2) of the principal regulations 
9. In regulation 27(2) (procedure following a claim) after sub-paragraph (c) there 

shall be inserted the following sub-paragraph-
"(cc) any necessary information within the meaning of regulation 18A 

(lesser deductions for certain non-dependants);". 

Amendment of regulation 51 of the principal regulations 
10. Regulation 51 of the principal regulations (supplement to rent rebate or rent 

allowance) shall be amended as follows- " 
(a) for paragraph (5) there shall be substituted the following paragraph­

"(5) Where a person entitled to a supplement on 21st November 1983 
becomes entitled subsequently under Part III of these regulations-

(a) to an increased amount of rent rebate or rent allowance, except an 
increase-



No. 280 Housing i}Ol 
\ 

(i) at 1st April 1984 occasioned by regulation 12(2) of the Hous,ng 
Benefits (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1984(a), or 

(ii) occasioned by a variation of any needs allowance under Article 4 of 
. the 1983 Order, 

that person 's supplement shall be reduced by the amount of such increase, 
and iftheamourtt of such increase exceeds the supplement, his entitlement 
toa supplement shall cease; 

(b) to a lesser amount of rent rebate or rent allowance, or to an increased 
amount occasioned by the circumstances specified in sub-paragraph (a)(i) 
or (ii), his supplement shall not thereby be altered."; 

(b) in paragraph (6) for "19th" there shall be substituted "26th"; 
(c) in paragraph (8) for" 17th" there shall be substituted "24th". 

Amendment of Schedule 1 to the principal regulations 
11. Schedule 1 to the principal regulations {students} shall be amended as 

follows-
(a) at the end of Part I there shall be added-

"Class 6: any award or grant for the purpose of attending a course of 
education which is financed out of the public funds of another 
country or is otherwise made by or on behalf of the government of, 
or an institution funded out of the public funds of, another 
country. "; 

(b) in Part II at the end of column 1 there shall be added "Class 6" and at the end 
of column 2 there shall be added' 'Thy period for which the grant or award in 
question is tenable.". 

Amendment of Schedule 2 to the principal regulations 
12. Schedule 2 to the principal regulations (amounts to be disregarded when 

ascertaining weekly income for any housing benefit) shall be amended as follows-
(a) in paragraph 4(a) and (b) tor "£17·45" in each place where it occurs, there 

shall be substituted "£17·00"; 
(b) in paragraph 17(b) for the words from "and that allowance" to the end there 

shall be substituted" such amount, if any, of that allowance expressed to be a 
lodging allowance"; 

(c) in paragraph 19(ab)for "£21·45" there shall be substituted "£22·45". 

Amendment of Schedule 3 to the principal regulations 
13.-(1) Schedule 3 to the principal regulations (deductions in respect of charges 

for fuel and services and in respect of rent for the purposes of computing eligible rent) 
shall be amended in accordance with the following paragraphs. 

(2) In paragraph 3(a) for "£6·05" there shall be substituted "£6·25". 
(3) In paragraph 3(b) and (d) for "£0·70" in each place where it occurs there shall 

be substituted "£0·75". 
(4) In par~graph 11-
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) (i) for "£2·70" there shall be substituted "£2·90"; 
(b) in sub-paragraph (a)(ii) for "£1·35" there shall be substituted "£1·45". 

(a) S.R. 1984 No. 77 



1302 Housing . No. 280 

Revocations 
14. Regulation 28 of the principal regulations is hereby revoked. 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Health and Social Services for 
Northern Ireland on 7th August 1984. 

A. N. Burns 
ASsistant Secretary 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of the Environment for Northern 
Ireland on 7th August 1984. . 

(L.s.) J. Kirk 
Assistant Secretary 

The Department of Finance and Personnel for Northern Ireland hereby consents to 
the foregoing regulations. 

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Finance and Personnel for 
Northern Ireland on 7th August 1984. 

(L.s.) R. G. Smartt 
Assistant Secretary 



No. 280 Housing 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations.) 

l303 

. These regulations amend the Housing Benefits Regulations (Northern Ireland) 
1983 ("the 1983 regulations") which contain the schemes for the grant of rate 
rebates, rent rebates and rent allowances (collectively called "housing benefits") by 
altering certain amounts, relevant for the purposes of calculating a person's 
entitlementto rebate or allowance, specified in the 1983 regulations; all the amounts 
altered are increased except for the amounts of earnings of an eligible person, or in 
certain cases of his partner, falling to be disregarded, which are decreased from 
£17·45 to £17·00. 

In addition, the regulations make the following amendments to the 1983 
regulations. 

Regulation 3 inserts a new regulation llA which provides that students from 
foreign countries other than signatories to the European Convention of Social and 
Medical Assistance 1953 are to be excluded from entitlement to housing benefits. 

Regulation 4 amends regulation 16 so as to provide that, where a person is entitled 
in a certificated case within the meaning of regulation 2(1) of the 1983 regulations to a 
i).0using benefit in respect of two homes, no deduction is to be made in the calculation 
of his eligible rent under the said regulation 16 for amounts in respect of fuel in respect 
of the home not occupied by the eligible person. . 

Regulation 5 amends regulation 1.8 so as to provide for a deduction to be made in 
the calculation of a person's housing benefits if a non-dependant aged 16 or 17 lives in 
his household; for no non-dependant deduction to apply where a 16 or 17 year old is in 
receipt of a non-contributory invalidity pension or for any period before the terminal 
date for the purposes of child benefit; and for the deduction in respect of a 
non-dependant, aged 18 to 20, to be aligned with that for such a non-dependant aged 
21 to pensionable age. 

Regulation 6 inserts a new regulation 18A which provides that lesser deductions 
in respect of certain non-dependants are no longer to be subject to the requirement of a 
special application and are to be made from the date when the conditions for the lesser 
deduction are first satisfied. ' 

Regulation 7 amends regulation 19 so as to provide that the percentage used to 
calculate the amount by which housing benefits are reduced for each pound of income 
above the needs allowance is increased from 7% to 9% in the case of rate rebate and 
from 21 % to 29% in the case of rent rebate or rent allowance'. I 

Regulation 8 amends regulation 20 so as to provide that in cases other than 
certificated cases under regulation 9 of the 1983 regulations, cases where the eligible 
person is in receipt of supplementary benefit which includes an amount in respect of 
housing benefit supplement, or cases where the weekly income of the eligible person 
and any partner of his falls below the level of the appropriate needs allowance, the 
minimum amount of a housing benefit which can be granted is 50 pence. 

Regulation 10 amends regulation 51 so as to provide that the amount of a special 
payment of rent rebate or rent allowance (made to certain persons under a transitory 
provision until November 1985) will not be altered on account of any increase in rent 
rebate or rent allowance occasioned by a variation of any needs allowance. 



1304 Housin[? No.28Q 

Regulation 11 amends Schedule 1 so as to provide that any grant a student 
receives from or on behalf of the government of another country is to be taken into 
account in the same way as if it were financed out of public funds in this country. 

Other amendments made by these regulations are minor or consequential upon 
those mentioned above. 


	00001
	00002
	00003
	00004
	00005
	00006
	00007
	00008



